Customs A9[1993]

5
GUYANA
ACT No. 9 OF 1993
CUSTOMS (AMENDMENT) ACT 1993

1 assent,

CHEDDI JAGAN,
President.

16th Aprl, 1993

ARRANGEMENT OF SECTTIONS

SECTION
1. Short title.
2, Amendment ef section 2 of the Principal Act
3 Amendment of section 199 of the Principal Act.

Frice 225.00 To be purchased from the Office of the President, Georgetown,
Guyana.

PRINTED BY GUYANA NATIONAL PRINTERS LTD.



No. 9]

2
LAWS OF GUYANA {A.D. 1993

A.D. 1993

Shkort title.
Cap. 82:01

Amenidment
of saction
2 of the
Principal
Act.

Amendment
af sectinn
igg of the
Principal
Act.

Amendment of section 200 of the Principal Act.

Repeal of section 201 of the Principal Act.

Amendnieni of section 204 of the Principal Act.

Repeal and re-enactment of section 205 of the Principal Act
Amendent of section 206 of the Principal Act.

Amendmeni of section 207 of the Principal Act.

Amendment of section 208 of the Principal Act
Amendmient of seciion 211 oi e Principal Act
Amendient of section 214 of the Principal Act.

Amendment of scction 215 of the Principal Act.

Amendment of scetion 216 of the Principal Act.

Repeal and re-cnaciment of section 217 of the Principal Act.
Amendment of section 218 of the Principal Act.
Amendment of scction 214 of the Principal Act.
Amendment of section 221 of the Principal Act.
Amendment of section 222 of the rincipal Act,

Repeal and re-enactment or Section 224 of the Prin ipal Act.
Amecndment of section 256 of the Principal Act.
Amendment of scetion 261 of the Principal Act.
Amendment of section 262 of the Principal Act.
Amendment of section 263 of the Principal Act.

AN ACT to amend the Costoms Act.

Enacted by the Parliament of Guyana:—

1. This Act, which amends the Customs Act, may be cited

as the Customs (Amcadmenty Act 1993.

2, Section 2 of the Principal Act is hereby amended by the
inscrtion  after the definition of “goods™, of the following de-

finition,

“Government  Analyst” includes the Assistant
Government Analyst and any Scientific officer

of the Analyst Department,”

3. Scction 199 of the Principal Act is hersby amended 1n

the folfowing respects —

(a) by the subsiitution for the word “is”, of the word
“or” after the word “found where It occurs for
the second time; and

(k) by the substitution for the words “one thousand
dollars”™, of the words “not.less thanone thousand
dollars nor more than five thousand dollars™.



3

A.D. 1993] CUSTOMS (AMENDMENT) [{No 9

4. Section 200 of the Principal Act is hereby amended in ~ Amendment

the following respects — Frincioal
(a} by the substitution for the marginal note, thercto,
of the foliowing marginal note -
“Smuggling aircraft and ships forfeited,”; and
(b} by the substitution for the words “Every ship of
less than two hundred and fifty tons burden”,
of the words “Every aircralt or ship™.

s. Section 201 of the Principal Act is hercby repealed. Repeaj of
section 201
of the
Principal
Act.

X Scgtion 204 of the Principal Act is hereby amended in the  Amendment

following rcspects — Fr Pt
Priuctpal |
Act.

(a) in subscction (2), by the substitution for the words
“three years”, of the words “five years™;

(b) in subsection (4), by the substitution for the words
“shall be liable for each such offence to a fine of
one thousand dollars”, of the words “shall be lia-
ble, on summary conviction, for each such offence
to a fine of not Iess than five thousand doltars
nor. more than ten thousand dollars together with
imprisonment for two years”; and

(¢} in subsection (5), by the substituiion for the words
“three months™, of the words “not less than three
months nor more than one vear™.

7. Section 205 of the Principal Act is hereby repealed and
the following section substituted thercfor —

";’r‘“"“v 205. (1) AIl persons to the mnumber of three or

Rssembling morce who shall assembie for the purpose of evad-

e ing any of the provisions of the customs laws shall

1o amemblsd cach be guilty of an offence and shall each be lia-

 eustoms. ble on summary conviction to imprisonment for

lawe. not less than twelve months nor more than thres
years:

Repeal and
re-enact-
ment of
seciton 203
of the Prin-
elpal Act.



4

Act.

Aamendment
of seetinn
215 of the
rrincipat
Aet.

No. 9] LAWS OF GUYANA [A.D. 1993
Provided that the court may for special rea-
sons to be reconded in writing award a scntence of
imprisonment for a shorter term than twelve months.
(2) All persons to the number of three or
more who having assembled for the purpose of
evading any of the provisions of the customs laws,
evade any such provision shall each be guilty of
an offence and shall cach be liabla on summary
comviction to imprisonment for not less than
twelve months nor more than three years:
Provided that the court may for special reasons
to be recorded in writing award a sentence of im-
prisonment for a shorter term than twelve months,”
Aimendment 8  Section 206 (1) of the Prinecipal Act is hereby amended
ﬁﬁ! the by the substitution for the words “twelve months”, of the words
§ilodbal “not less than twelve months nor more than five ycars”,
Ameuamare 9. Section 207 of the Principal Act iy hereby amended by
207 of the the substitution for the words “shall be liable to a fine of five
Friaciosl bundred dollars”, of the words “shall be liable on summary con-
viction to a fing of ten thousand doilars together with imprison-
ment for three years”.
Amendment 10.  Section 208 of the Principa] Act is hercby amended by
e af the the substitation for the words “two hugpdred dollirs”, of the words
RFrinetyal “five thousand dollars”
Amendmem 11.  Secuon 211 of the Principal Act is hereby amended by
$11.°51 the the substitution for the words “‘one thoysand dollars”, of the words
Princival “not less than five thousand dollars nor more than ten thousand
dollars”.
Aacadméfit 12, Section 214 of the Principal Act is hereby amended by
o sectiod  the substitution for the words “shall 1e liable to a fine of five
Princtpal

bundred dollars”, of the worls “shall be liable on summary con-
victibil té a fine of ten théusand dollars together with imprison-
ment for three years™.

13, Section 215 of the Princips; Act is hereby amended
by the substitution for the words “pne thousand five hundred
dollars and to imprisonment for a term of three months”, of the
wordf, “ten thousand dollars together with imprisonment for three
years'.



5

AD. 1993] CUSTOMS (AMENDMENT) [No. 9

14. Section 216 of the Principal Act is hereby amended by ﬁfm::gﬁl::'
the substitutior: for the words “one thousand dollars”, of the words 216 of the
“ten thousand dollars”. i

15. Section 217 of the Principal Act is hereby repealed and r:_ze::ctnu
the following section substituted therefor — ment of e

o

“Penalty for 217 (1) Any person who, in any matter relating  pal Aet.
i;‘d:;’ ’:gf." to the customs, or under the control or manage-

ment of the Comptroller —

(@)

)

fcy

d

makes and subscribes, or causcs to
be made and subscribed, any false
declaration; or

makes or signs or causes to be made
or signed, any declaration, certificate
or other instrument required to be
veiified by signature only, the same
being fasc in any particular; or

make, or sign: any declaration made
for the consideration of any officer
on any application presented to him,
the same being untrue in any
particular, or

when required by the customs laws
to answer questions put to him by
any officer, refuses to amswer such
questions or answers any such ques-
tions untruly,

shall be liable on summary conviction to a fine of

twenty five

thousand dollars together with im-

prisonment for three years,

(2) Any person who, in any matter relating
to the customs, or vnder the control or manage-
ment of the Comptroller -—

(a)

counterfeiis, falsifies, or wilfully uses
when counterfeited or falsified, any
document requited by the customs
laws, or by or under the directions
of any officer, or any instrument used
in the transaction of any businese or
matter relating to customs: or



[

No. 9} LAWS OF GUYANA [A.D. 1993
(b) alters any document or instrument
afier the sume has been officiafly
issued: or
(c) counterieits  the seal, signature,
initals or other mark of or used by
any officer for the verification of any
such document or instrument, or for
the security of goods, or any other
purpose in the conduct of business
relating to the customs, or under the
control or managenient of the Comp-
troller: or
) on any document or instrument re-
quired for the purpose of the customs
laws, counterfeits or imitates the seal.
signature, inilials or other mark of
or madc use of by any other person
whatsoever, whéther with or without
the copsent of such person,
shall be liable on summary conviction to a fine
of ten thousand dollars togsther with imprison-
ment for not less than twelve months nor more
than three years.”
Amendment 16.  Section 218 of the Principal Act is hereby amended
s % whe by the substitution for the words “one thousand dollars”, of the
Princial words “ten thousand dollars”.
%‘;‘:Qﬁ{{“ﬁ,“‘ N lf‘.’A“ Section 219 of the Principal Act is bereby amended in
{1 —
v 2ot ahe the following respects
(a) by the insertion after the word “goods™, wherever it
appears, of the words “or thing™;
(b) by the substitution for the words “one thousand
dollars”, of the words “ten thousand dollars”; and
¢) by the deletion of the words “contained in such
package”.
Jmendment 18.  Scction 221 of the Principal Act is wreby amended by

221 of Lhe
Principal
Act,

‘the substitution for the words “shall be liablg for every offence

to a finc of one thonsand dollars”, of the words “shall be liable



=
{

AD. 1993} CUSTOMS (AMENDMENT)

[No, 9
on summary conviction, for cvery such olfence, to a fine of ten
thousansd dollars together with imprisonment for three years™.

19.  Segtion 222 of the Principal Act is hereby amended by — Amendment
the substitution for the words “'shall be liable to a finc of live 222 ot the
thousand dollags” in both the places where they occur, of the words ~ Frincioat
“shall be liable on summary conviction to a {ine of ten thousand
dollars together with imprisonment for threc years™.

20.  Section 224 of the Principal Act is hereby repealed and ~ hepesd and
the following section substituted therefor — ment of

sectlon 224
of the Prin-
clpal :
“Genera} 224, (1) All aircrafl, ships and carriages, together
BTy with all animals and things made use of in the
forfeiture. importation, attempred imporiation, landing, re-
moval, conveyance, exportation or attempted cx-
poration of any uncustomed, probibited or re-
stricted goods. or any goods liable to forleiture
under the customs laws shall be forfeited.
(2) Al aircraft, ships and carriages, fo-
gether with all animals and things, and goods lia-
ble to forfeiture, and all persons habic to be de-
taincd for anv offence, under the customs laws
or under any law whereby officers are authorised
to muke scizeres or delentions. shall or mav be
scized or dtained in any place by any person duly
employed for the prevention of smuggling or hy
anv person having authority from the Comptroller
to scize or detain the same.
(3) Al aircraft. ships and carriages. to-
pethar  with all animals and things, and  goods
seized nnder subsection (21 shall forthwith be de-
livered into the care of the Comptroller.
() The forlciture of any aircraft. ship,
carriage, animal or thing shall be deemed to in-
ctude the furniture, tackle, harness and apparct
thercol, and the forfeiture of any poods shall be
deemed to include the package in which the same
are found and all the contents thercof.”

21, Section 256 of the Principal Act is herehy amended — Amondment
by the substitution for the words “one vear”, of the words “two 256 of the
years™, Priacinal

Act,



8

No. 9] LAWS OF GUYANA [AD. 1993
22, Section 261 (1) of the Principal Act is hereby amended  Amemcment
by the substitution for the words “ship or goods” wherever they 261 of the

appear, of the words “ship, goods or things”. Princiaal

23. Section 262 of the Principal Act is hereby amended by 3?’333:’1’51"‘
the substitution for the words “ship or goods”, of the words “ship, 203 of the
goods or things”, and for the word “things™, of the words “animal, Princival
carriage, aircraft, ship, goods or things”. -

24. Section 263 of the Principal Act is hereby amended by  Amendment

o - - of section
the insertion after the word “prosecution” of the words “er pro- 3 ot the

ing" Principal
ceeding”. Act.

Passed bu the National Assembly on 24th March, 1993.

¥. A. Narain,
Clerk of the National Assembly.

(BILI. No. 7/1993)



